
These days away from home and normal “distractions” are foundational for the kind of 
social, physical and spiritual growth you desire for your children, not to mention fun, 
creative and adventurous experiences. And what about the life-long friends they will 
meet? 
  
Camp Jonah specializes in small, hands-on “Theme Camps.” Check out our website for 
the many options we have available for all ages of children. Is your child interested in 
the outdoors and high adventure or missions or girl stuff or man stuff? Are your par-
ents interested in creating a lasting memory with your kids by attending our Grand 
Camp with them? Perhaps your youth leaders would like to bring a group of kids to 
camp and stay to experience the week with them? 
  
Our goals are simple: 1) That the kids would have fun! 2) That each camper would take 
the next step in their walk with God. 
  
Our camps are unique in that the whole day is scheduled-not a bunch of free time. But 
we also plan in guided times of reflection so that the campers can process the week 
prior to heading home. Our goal is not just a week of fun, but a week that changes a 
life! 
  
And then there is the opportunity for your teen to apply for a summer staff position. 
Talk about life-changing! Kids that learn to serve at camp often choose to let Jesus use 
them in fulltime missions later on. Or they live purposeful lives that reflect Jesus 
wherever they go. 
  
Simply put: Camp changes lives. And Christian Camps change lives for eternity!! 
  
As you look at your goals for those precious children of yours, and begin to plan out 
their summer schedule, we urge you to seriously consider summer camp. We would be 
honored to have your child attend one of our camps, and if you have any questions or 
concerns we’d love to chat with you by phone or email or facebook! It’s that important 
to us! 
  
Be sure to check out our website. Check out the kinds of Theme Camps we offer. Check 
out the depth of the Staff Application that shows how serious we are about the kind of 
people who join our staff. Talk to Sherri, our Program Director, about the new Child 
Protection Plan we have in place for this summer. Talk to any of our Camp Directors 
to hear their goals for each week of camp. 
  
One more thing. If you’re worried about money, give me a call. We will take ANY pay-
ment plan you come up with. We know camp is expensive. We’d offer it for free if we 
could. We also know the value that comes with this kind of investment, so we’ll work 
with you to make it possible for your child to get to camp! 
  
We are convinced that God invented camp, and we would love to have your kids join 

us this summer! 


